
TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE

Buyer: Danielle Toler FY: 2021   
Bid #: RFQ-21-908 Dept: FRP/Veronica Davenport/Bruce Woods      

TABULATION SHEET 1 2 3 4 5 6

Company
Address

City, State
Terms

FOB
Delivery (calendar days)

Quoted by
Minority   W/O

CMBL

# Qty Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price

1 Bandit Brush Chipper Model 75XP 1        19256.75 19,256.75    19306.04 19,306.04    23997.12 23,997.12    No Bid No Bid No Response

2 Freight 1        1500.00 1,500.00      1750.00 1,750.00      800.00 800.00         -               -               -               

3 -               -               -               -               -               -               

4 -               -               -               -               -               -               

5  -               -               -               -               -               -               

6  -               -               -               -               -               -               

7 -               -               -               -               -               -               

8  -               -               -               -               -               -               

9 -               -               -               -               -               -               

10 -               -               -               -               -               -               

11 -               -               -               -               -               -               

12 -               -               -               -               -               -               

13 -               -               -               -               -               -               

14 -               -               -               -               -               -               

15 -               -               -               -               -               -               

16 -               -               -               -               -               -               

17 -               -               -               -               -               -               

18 -               -               -               -               -               -               

19 -               -               -               -               -               -               

20 -               -               -               -               -               -               

21  -               -               -               -               -               -               

22 -               -               -               -               -               -               

TOTAL 20,756.75$  21,056.04$  24,797.12$  No Bid No Bid No Response

      Reason for award:

 Staff Award Recommendation    X Low Bid Meeting Specs

__ Sole Source
Danielle Toler 25-Feb-21 __ Best Value

signature __ Other  ____________

I certify that no other bids or responses were received  _________________

date

BL/M
Yes

N/A

 Baytech Supply Inc 
 PO Box 6343 

San Antonio, TX 78209
Net 30

WO/F
No

WO/F
Yes

Simba Industries
PO Box 3141

Grapevine, TX 76099
Net 30

Dest
N/A

Yes
No
Yes

Dest
N/A
N/A

Dest
N/A

Anthony Romagnoli Heath Williamson
WO/FNo

Jason Morey

Bandit Industries
6750 Millbrook Road

Remus, MI 49340

Thomas Brabandt

Dest
N/A

Burgoon Company (EVCO)
PO Box 290

Texas City, TX 77592
Net 30

Brabandt Equipment
PO Box 8565

Round Rock, TX 78683
Net 30
Dest
N/A

Net 30

No

Earthco Landscape Con.
LLC 4500 Dr Ste 212-108
Georgetown, TX 78633

Net 30
Dest
N/A
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TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE

  

TABULATION SHEET  (cont'd pg 2)  7 8 9 10 11 12

Company
Address

City, State
Terms

FOB
Delivery (calendar days)

Quoted by
Minority   W/O

CMBL

# Qty Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price Unit Price Ext.Price

1 Bandit Brush Chipper Model 75XP 1        No Response -               -               -               -               -               

2 Freight 1        -               -               -               -               -               -               

3 -               -               -               -               -               -               

4 -               -               -               -               -               -               

5 -               -               -               -               -               -               

6 -               -               -               -               -               -               

7 -               -               -               -               -               -               

8 -               -               -               -               -               -               

9 -               -               -               -               -               -               

10  -               -               -               -               -               -               

11 -               -               -               -               -               -               

12 -               -               -               -               -               -               

13 -               -               -               -               -               -               

14 -               -               -               -               -               -               

15 -               -               -               -               -               -               

16 -               -               -               -               -               -               

17 -               -               -               -               -               -               

18 -               -               -               -               -               -               

19 -               -               -               -               -               -               

20 -               -               -               -               -               -               

21 -               -               -               -               -               -               

22 -               -               -               -               -               -               

23 -               -               -               -               -               -               

TOTAL No Response -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             

   
   

N/A
N/A

Texas Tractor Country
1175 FM 306

New Braunfels, TX 78130
Net 30

No
Yes

Dest
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